RNI No. MAHBIL /2009/37831

Hel S IMME qSTaA
3THTELNUT YT AR-

a9 99, 3k 23%] YehaR, TR 93, 014/ WIEUE 32, ITeh 23%9 [T <, fea : 5T Q.00

STITNUT shHieh 333

UTTereha UehT9T=
TENRTE ITTEAT HERTSE ART-aHi~aa aa) shetet
(T Ueh, Weh- 37 3TUT Ueh-oT ATHEN UTAg shee! FHaW o ATR9T AT taed ) fFam o smewr.

TE (Sie)) foaamr

HaE Yoo 03R, faieh 22 AL 04,

Iferg=mT

(=N

HERTE AT gaeh TUTHEH, 094,

T TehivT-0% L & /.55, 90 /Aex-2 . —<areelf, & fasnT 1= 6. MIS-0%2&/C.R.290/PRT-2, f&ish
© AR 02E Y (ST I& “TR SR Teeel STeal ), HERT, Alehal gaeh UMW, 084 (RoQy =
TRl 32 ) TN HAT 3 (2) T4 e SARTHRITAR, & farammrean 2ifemed g wreisrt s, Terme 9r e
AT AR T TRTTAHTR I "AVRIShiHT foe=T SO STesi-eh Hali=l Feit ST =1 Hell JeT uaras =
T ehTeTwRIter, Tefeira stfep, wem eTdier eifererrt onifon fadier srdiet sifert sifergfaa sivard o1t 2Te

3foT SAreTelf, SR WX STERIaIet Sl Aresi-eh Haie (RS [Gad ) HeT ShuardTe! shieTwarey
ST YT A ATed, T el T A=A AR Y& eI SR, HeRTg ARl Hees i< fHasumaretier
FHIITAIHTGT 5o o< Taied faea STdiet, T3 Har= fard hicTHaier TeeTyH™ToT FaTfed sl STE.

ST, TR, HENI Teha g SR, 024 (024 =M HEl. 32) =T oM 3 (1) 139 W
ATIRRITER, e faramrea st 9 sl 2Afeehl, HeRTs qIR Hees e fsomaredier et
T ARIRIT foea ST HeEX SATREiet Sast-eh ol 5T AT shieTHatal sl hee JEIcTo o] Jerom
el 2T :—

()
I FR-F-333-¢



HERTS IIE TSI STHTERUT W 9o, el €3, R0R4/HTFUE 2, ITh 2%9
T A=, RIS, —
(i) 313, T, Wi (3) e “go fead” A Uas “wu faaer”” STefl Yemon ivard 9 o1,

(i) 313, I UL, W9 (3) TeH “9R oo A1 uastt “g o feaq” SToil FerRon hivard 4 o1,

(iii) 313k, 3 7, W (3) TeA “Qu Toae”” A Uarstt “o faam™” oTell Yo Sivard 9 o71s;

(iv) 313k 4 TEl, 9 (3) 7o “¢ T A varstt “3 foa”” srefl geron Sivard Iq 31e;

TERTS 54T J9uTel Il STSIMTER F 16,

T W,

QST TR & Gf.




TERTSE, I TSI STETERUT HAT IR-, FEa R, R0 /HIFUE R, Ioh 23%9 3
HOME (PORT) DEPARTMENT

Madam Cama Road, Hutatma Rajguru Chowk, Mantralaya,
Mumbai 400 032, Dated the 12th September 2025.

NOTIFICATION

MAaHARASHTRA RigHT TO PUBLIC SERVICES AcT, 2015.

No.MISC-0916/C.R.170/PORT-1.—Whereas the Home Department has vide Government
Notification, Home Department, No.MIS-0916/C.R.170/PRT-1, dated the 7th November 2016
(hereinafter referred to as “the said notification”), issued in exercise of the powers conferred by
sub-section (1) of section 3 of the Maharashtra Right to Public Services Act, 2015 (Mah. XXXI of 2015),
notified the public services to be rendered to the eligible persons by offices under the control of Chief
Executive Officer, Maharashtra Maritime Board alongwith the stipulated time limit for providing
such public services by the offices, the Designated Officers, First Appellate Authority and Second
Appellate Authority;

And whereas, the Home Department considers it expedient to reduce the time limit for providing
certain public services (working days) by offices under the control of Chief Executive Officer,
Maharashtra Maritime Board specified provided in the Schedule appended to the said notification.

Now, therefore, in exercise of the powers conferred by sub-section (7) of section 3 of the
Maharashtra Right to Public Services Act, 2015 (Mah. XXXI of 2015), the Home Department hereby
reduces the time limit for providing certain public services (working days) by the Chief Executive
Officer, Maharashtra Maritime Board and for that purpose amends the said notification as follows,

namely :—
In the said notification, in the Schedule appended thereto,—

(1) in entry at Sr. no. 1, in column (3) for the word and figures “60 days” the word and
figures “45 days” shall be substituted;

(i) in entry at Sr. no. 2, in column (3) for the word and figures “12 days” the word and
figures “10 days” shall be substituted;

(i17) in entry at Sr. no. 3, in column (3) for the word and figures “15 days” the word and
figures “7 days” shall be substituted;

(iv) in entry at Sr. no. 5, in column (3) for the word and figure “8 days” the word and
figures “3 days” shall be substituted.

By Order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra,

SANJAY SETHI,
Additional Chief Secretary to Government.

AT TR-9-3%3—-R



¥ HERTS I TSI STETLRUT T TR-, FEa R, R0 Y% /HTFUE R, Ioh £3%9

HEWT, Tlehial gaeh SIUTEH, R024,

TE (Sie?) foaamr

H&E ¥oo 03R, fai® 2R T 0’4,

Sferg=m=T

(=N

SHHih Hehl0T-0Q 28 /7.55.2\90 /AEl-2. — HERTSE il gaeh SAMEH, 2024 (024 TTHEL 32 ) =T THetd
3 (2) ST W SARIPRITER, I ATER 3o AT FRrsTre SRt ehotedn Tl forermT= g, o7 fehar
FHIIEHA & hed, e A= 1R T SR e, HeRme ARl Hees A Tomdeh fFesmmareiel
(2), (%), (W) 3T (&) e Tfdee heammmoT Affad i 317,

uifTe
.. | AR auEie | cAlehden | TefreR st Worq 370t ESIRE ]
EUELRIEICH RCSit) AR UG/ | SR TeH /
fafed seret TR a1/ A I/
EAGLRIE] e hHih e HHIh
(2) (R) (3) (%) (W) (%)
02 ISEICESCISH 02 T, AT, TAFEFR | FIH Fa / 3R
IfoT STeARTeE o, WRAEl, @R (9.), | 9 Hes, 8. | (RaeTaaw),
Hegeqo HefE - ¥oo o4R. 03R -RR82R2%¥3 | TE forum, wetd,
ORI 0R%-R§0¥L\9oR g’aé- oo 03R.
TRAT.
o} | “HeRIZ | %0 faed TR TR, A FERN | T Afa/eTR
Sgiee 0% - §R0%29\ il Hee, UaE. | (RaeT a o),
S CEECIPENE ] 0RR - §Ro%¥2V%L | RN I
Ml (Over 03R-R03%008
Dimensional
Cargo)
HEIEIEIE)
TRAT.




WERTSE I TS STETARUT HRT AR-, G 2R, 034 /HIFUS R, I 2% “
.. | APHAA AU | ARG | USRI St Worq 370t Tt edier
ERELLIEIEH) RCSit) AR TG/ | SR 9o /
fafed hetet TR a1/ EARIGRIE R
EAGLRIE] e ShHih e hHIh
(2) (R) (3) (%) (W) (%)
03 det 3TNNEE, © feomT EIEAERER TS & R T Wi erel/ 3TN
afed T (DPR) 03 - §R0%200W il Uee, §os. | (URaeT aER),
3. TR OIS 033 - §R0%¥2000 |  HENTT IMEA
EEEEILED 033-330%0008
TR o -
qifeh FARTOTHIST
TR
0% EE o feag R TN, A FERN | T Gfa/eTR
AATOIFER Fe 033 - §30%2000 il Hge, §os. | (URaeT adey),
Feme g 0% - §]0%200% |  HERTSE AT
0T QAT 0R3-330%Yy00%
oy el e deh 30 feaw e Sl SN, TAFERR | T Ao/ TR
a7t 0% - §R0%29\ il Hee, g, | (RaeT a o),
0R -§R0%¥VLVY HaTS RMHA
0R3-3R0RYy 008
0§ TaTd! e © feag TR deX PN, | g R SN, | R e
37 ENGICEEE:L 033 -§R0%2VV1 | 037 -§R0%¥2VLL
09 | BT dIC WA | 30 foad A S SATEehnl, T FEEN | TEH AFEa/3Tm
e, il Hges, §os. | (URaeT addy),
0% - §R0%¥29\0 0%% -§R0%VV HIREE AMMHAT
0R3-3R0RYy 008
ot Wl e 30 feag T ST ST, eI pER T Wi/ TR
e, il Hges, §os. | (WRaeT addy),
0% - §R0%¥2V 0%% -§R0%¥2WVV HIREE AMMHA
0R3-3R0RYy 008

AT FR--333 -3




3 TERTEZ IITE TSI STETERUT WA -, HEa £3, 2034 /HIFUE 32, Ik 23%9
.. | AR auEie | cAlehden | UefreR st Worq 370t Tt edier
ERELLIEIEH) RCSit) AR TG/ | SR 9o /
fafed hetet TR a1/ EARIGRIE R
CAGER ] el ShHih AT SRR
(2) (R) (3) (%) (W) (%)
o] | HHAN [Eesl | 3o feaw e Sl SN, T FEEN | TEH AFEa/3TR
e, il Hee, UaE. | (RaeT a o),
0RQ - §R0%¥2VVE | 0% -§Ro¥QVVe |  HENIY ITEA
%0 e e oo feam | T 9 et / M X | A SR S,
e,
032 - §30%200
22 TR HIUHT o\ feag ERIEicd Bean A FERN | T Gfa/eTR
b GES il Hee, UaE. | (RaeT a o),
0% -§R0o%¥LVLVY 0%% -§R 0%V HIRTEE AMMHAT
0R3-3R0RYy 008
93 | A TAWWAT | 2y feam SufSTeRTieeR, T IR T Gfed/ TR
e, il Hee, UaE. | (RaeT a o),
0RR ~§R0%200 0% -§R0¥Q00Y |  HENIY T

0%%-%R0RKo00%

HERTSE T ST e STSIMTER o A,

ST WA,

YA TR & 9a.




WERTS I TS STHTLRUT WRT TIR-o, T ¢, 2034 /WU R, I1h 2]%9
HOME (PORT) DEPARTMENT

Madam Cama Road, Hutatma Rajguru Chowk, Mantralaya,

Mumbai 400 032, Dated the 12th September 2025.

NOTIFICATION

MAaHARASHTRA RiGgHT TO PUBLIC SERVICES AcT, 2015.

No.MISC-0916/C.R.170/PORT-1.—In exercise of the powers conferred by sub-section (1) of section
3 of the Maharashtra Right to Public Services Act, 2015 (Mah. XXXI of 2015), and in supersession

of all the existing notifications, orders or instruments issued in this behalf, the Home Department,

hereby notifies the public services specified in column (2) of the Schedule appended herewith, to be
rendered to the eligible persons, by the offices, under the administrative control of the Chief Executive

Officer, Maharashtra Maritime Board, along with the stipulated time limit for providing such public

services, the Designated Officers, First Appellate Authorities and Second Appellate Authorities, as
specified in columns (3), (4), (5) and (6), respectively, of the said Schedule, for the purposes of the

said Act.
Schedule
Sr. Name of Time Designated First Appellate Second Appellate
No. Publi . limit for Officer by Whom Authority Authority
ublic Service . . .
providing | services will be
service Provided
(working
days)
(1) (2) (3) (4) (5) (6)
01 | Geotechnical, | 01 Month Hydrographer, | Chief Executive | Principle Secretary/
Geophysical Maharashtra Officer, Additional Chief
and Maritime Board, | Maharashtra Secretary
Hydrographic Khardanda, Khar Maritime (Transport & Ports),
Survey (W), Mumbai-52. | Board, Mumbai. | Home Department,
Permission Ph-022 26045702 Ph-022 Mantralaya,
22612143 Mumbai - 400 032
022-220250009.
02 | Permission for 10 days Nautical Advisor | Chief Executive | Principal Secretary/
handling Over Maharashtra Officer Additional Chief
Dimensional Maritime Board Maharashtra Secretary
Cargo (ODC) 022 - 69041777 | Maritime Board | (Transport & Ports),
from MMB 022 - 69041777 Government of
jetties Maharashtra,
Mumbai - 400 032.
022-220250009.
03 | Permission for 7 days Nautical Advisor | Chief Executive | Principal Secretary/
Hydrographic Maharashtra Officer Additional Chief
survey/ Maritime Board Maharashtra Secretary
geophysical 022 - 69041777 | Maritime Board | (Transport & Ports),
survey/ 022 - 69041777 Government of
geotechnical Maharashtra,

survey for port
planning, DPR
preparation
ete.

Mumbai - 400 032.
022-22025009.




HERTS I TSI STETLRUT T TR-, FEa R, R0 Y% /HTFUE R, Ioh £3%9

Sr. Name of Time Designated First Appellate Second Appellate
No. Publi . limit for Officer by Whom Authority Authority
ublic Service ... . .
providing | services will be
service Provided
(working
days)
(D (2) 3) 4) (5) (6)
Permission 7 days Nautical Advisor | Chief Executive | Principal Secretary/
04 for Dredging Maharashtra Officer Additional Chief
in Navigation Maritime Board Maharashtra Secretary
Channel as per 022 - 69041777 | Maritime Board | (Transport & Ports),
the request of 022 - 69041777 Government of
Port Operators Maharashtra,
Mumbai - 400 032.
022-220250009.
05 Passenger 30 days Chief Ports Chief Executive | Principal Secretary/
Route Officer, Officer, Additional Chief
permission — Maharashtra Maharashtra Secretary
New Maritime Maritime . (Transport & Port),
Application Board,Mumbai. | Board, Mumbai. | Govt of Maharashtra,
022 - 69041777 | 022 -69041777 Mumbai - 400 032.
022-22025009.
Passenger 7 days Regional Chief Ports Chief Executive
06 Route Ports Officer, Officer, Officer, Maharashtra
permission — Maharashtra Maharashtra Maritime Board,
Renewal Maritime Maritime ‘ Mumbai.
Application Board, Bandra/ | Board, Mumbai. 022 — 69041777
Mora/Rajpuri/ 022 - 69041777
Ratnagiri/
Vengurla
07 | Permission to 30 days Chief Ports Chief Executive | Principal Secretary/
start House Officer, Officer, Additional Chief
Boat Maharashtra Maharashtra Secretary
Maritime Board, Maritime (Transport & Port),
Mumbai. Board, Mumbai. | Govt of Maharashtra,
022 - 69041777 | 022 -69041777 Mumbai - 400 032.
022-220250009.
08 | Permission to 30 days Chief Ports Chief Executive | Principal Secretary/
start Harbour Officer, Officer, Additional Chief
Cruise Maharashtra Maharashtra Secretary
Maritime Board, Maritime (Transport & Port),
Mumbai. Board, Mumbai. | Govt of Maharashtra,
022 - 69041777 | 022 -69041777 Mumbai - 400 032.
022-220250009.
09 Permission 30 days Chief Ports Chief Executive | Principal Secretary/
to transport Officer, Officer, Additional Chief
labour Maharashtra Maharashtra | Secretary (Transport
Maritime Board, Maritime & Port), Govt of
Mumbai. Board, Mumbai. Maharashtra,

022 - 69041777

022 - 69041777

Mumbai - 400 032.
022-220250009.




TERTSE I AU STHTERUT ST IH-°, AL 23, 034 /HTEUE 2, 91 23%9

Sr. Name of Time Designated First Appellate Second Appellate
No. Publi . limit for Officer by Whom Authority Authority
ublic Service ... . .
providing | services will be
service Provided
(working
days)
(D (2) 3) 4) (5) (6)
10 | Port Clearance 01 day Asstt. Port Regional Port Chief Ports Officer,
Inspector / Port Officer Maharashtra
Inspector Maritime Board,
Mumbai.
022 - 69041777
11 Event 07 Days Deputy Collector, | Chief Executive | Principal Secretary/
Permission Maharashtra Officer, Additional Chief
Maritime Board, | Maharashtra Secretary
Mumbai. Maritime (Transport & Ports),
Board, Mumbai. | Home Department,
022 - 69041777 Mantralaya,
Mumbai- 400 032.
022-22025009.
12 Sand Depo 15 Days | Deputy Collector, | Chief Executive | Principal Secretary/
Permission Maharashtra Officer, Additional Chief
Maritime Board, | Maharashtra Secretary
Mumbai. Maritime (Transport & Ports),
Board, Mumbai. | Home Department,
022 - 69041777 Mantralaya,
Mumbai- 400 032.
022-220250009.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra,

SANJAY SETHI,
Additional Chief Secretary to Government.

ON BEHALF OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY DIRECTOR,
RUPENDRA DINESH MORE, PRINTED AT GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD,
MUMBAI 400 004 AND PUBLISHED AT DIRECTORATE OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATIONS,
21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004. EDITOR : DIRECTOR, RUPENDRA DINESH MORE.




